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Date: December 13, 2016 
 
To: Mayor Parris and City Council Members 
 
From: Britt Avrit, CMC, City Clerk 
 
Subject: Consideration of adoption of Ordinance No. 1018 
 
 
Recommendation: 
Adopt Ordinance No. 1018, amending title 15 of the Lancaster Municipal Code by repealing 
Ordinance Number 994, and adopting by reference the 2016 edition of the California Building 
Code as amended herein; adopting by reference the 2016 edition of the California Residential Code 
as amended herein; adopting by reference the 2016 edition of the California Electrical Code as 
amended herein; adopting by reference the 2016 edition of the California Mechanical Code; 
adopting by reference the 2016 edition of the California Plumbing Code as amended herein; 
adopting the Lancaster Security Code as contained herein; adopting by reference the 2015 edition 
of the International Property Maintenance Code as amended herein; adopting by reference the 2016 
edition of the California Energy Code as amended herein; adopting by reference the 2016 edition of 
the California Historical Building Code; adopting by reference the 2017 edition of the Los Angeles 
County Fire Code; adopting by reference the 2016 edition of the California Green Building 
Standards Code; adopting by reference the 2016 edition of the California Existing Building Code; 
and adopting by reference the 2016 California Referenced Standards code, as the Lancaster codes 
for buildings and construction, all pertaining to life and safety and to the construction, alteration, 
moving demolition, repair, maintenance, and use of buildings, structures, and properties within the 
City. 
 
Fiscal Impact:  
None.  By adopting the 2016 California Codes, with minimal amendments, the City will ensure that 
the City’s codes for building and construction reflect the most current industry and regulatory 
standards, including those related to health and safety. The City still retains the option to adopt more 
restrictive measures as desired in the future. 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

Background: 
At the October 25, 2016 City Council meeting, the City Council approved the introduction of 
Ordinance No. 1018 by the following vote:  
 
AYES: Council Members Malhi, Underwood-Jacobs, Vice Mayor Crist, Mayor Parris 
NOES:  None 
ABSTAIN: None 
ABSENT: Mann 
 
Attachment: 
Ordinance No. 1018 


